
CITY OF SIDNEY
BID TABULATION

Purchase of:  Water Treatment Chemicals
Bid Opening Date:  12/07/2021
21-WTC-W AQUA KINETICS INC BONDED CHEMICALS BRENNTAG SOUTHEAST INC CABOT NORIT AMERICAS CALGON CARBON CARMEUSE LIME INC

Item # Quantity Description

1 12,000 lbs. Potassium Permanganate 2.2900 2.1100

2 60,000 lbs. Powdered Activated Carbon 0.6560 0.9700 0.7600

3 65 dry ton Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 522.0000

4 13,000 lbs. Sodium Tripolyphosphate 1.9200 2.2800

5 1,700 ton Pebble Lime 198.0000

6 10,500 gal. Liquid Ferric Sulfate 50 %

7 50,000 lbs Watersolve 9275, ZetaLyte 1.8100 1.6130

840C, NRP 8410 Polymer (or equal)

8 190 ton Liquid Carbon Dioxide

9 1,650 gal. Aqueous Sodium Bisulfite 2.5850 2.2000

10 6,000 gal. Liquid Sodium  Hypochlorite 5.25 % 1.2400

11 4,125 gal Hydrochloric Acid 31% 3.000 2.330



CITY OF SIDNEY
BID TABULATION

Purchase of:  Water Treatment Chemicals
Bid Opening Date:  12/07/2021
21-WTC-W

Item # Quantity Description

1 12,000 lbs. Potassium Permanganate

2 60,000 lbs. Powdered Activated Carbon

3 65 dry ton Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

4 13,000 lbs. Sodium Tripolyphosphate

5 1,700 ton Pebble Lime

6 10,500 gal. Liquid Ferric Sulfate 50 %

7 50,000 lbs Watersolve 9275, ZetaLyte 

840C, NRP 8410 Polymer (or equal)

8 190 ton Liquid Carbon Dioxide

9 1,650 gal. Aqueous Sodium Bisulfite

10 6,000 gal. Liquid Sodium  Hypochlorite 5.25 %

11 4,125 gal Hydrochloric Acid 31%

CHEMRITE INC CHEMTRADE COYNE CHEMICAL GREER INDUSTRIES INC KEMIRA LHOIST

2.2800

609.0000

188.0000 335.8000

1.9987 1.9920

NO BID



CITY OF SIDNEY
BID TABULATION

Purchase of:  Water Treatment Chemicals
Bid Opening Date:  12/07/2021
21-WTC-W

Item # Quantity Description

1 12,000 lbs. Potassium Permanganate

2 60,000 lbs. Powdered Activated Carbon

3 65 dry ton Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

4 13,000 lbs. Sodium Tripolyphosphate

5 1,700 ton Pebble Lime

6 10,500 gal. Liquid Ferric Sulfate 50 %

7 50,000 lbs Watersolve 9275, ZetaLyte 

840C, NRP 8410 Polymer (or equal)

8 190 ton Liquid Carbon Dioxide

9 1,650 gal. Aqueous Sodium Bisulfite

10 6,000 gal. Liquid Sodium  Hypochlorite 5.25 %

11 4,125 gal Hydrochloric Acid 31%

LINDE INC NRP MIDWEST PENNCO INC POLYDYNE INC SHANNON CHEMICAL CORP UNIVAR SOLUTIONS

2.5700

1.7700

1.6400

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



CITY OF SIDNEY
BID TABULATION

Purchase of:  Water Treatment Chemicals
Bid Opening Date:  12/07/2021
21-WTC-W

Item # Quantity Description

1 12,000 lbs. Potassium Permanganate

2 60,000 lbs. Powdered Activated Carbon

3 65 dry ton Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

4 13,000 lbs. Sodium Tripolyphosphate

5 1,700 ton Pebble Lime

6 10,500 gal. Liquid Ferric Sulfate 50 %

7 50,000 lbs Watersolve 9275, ZetaLyte 

840C, NRP 8410 Polymer (or equal)

8 190 ton Liquid Carbon Dioxide

9 1,650 gal. Aqueous Sodium Bisulfite

10 6,000 gal. Liquid Sodium  Hypochlorite 5.25 %

11 4,125 gal Hydrochloric Acid 31%

USALCO WATER SOLUTIONS

3.0500

512.2600

1.7500

.53/lb
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