
CITY OF SIDNEY
BID TABULATION

Purchase of:  Water Treatment Chemicals
Bid Opening Date:  12/01/20 Air Products and Chemicals Atlantic Coast Bonded Chemicals Inc. CarbPure Technologies Carmeuse Lime Chemtrade Chemicals
20-WTC-W 7201 Hamilton Blvd 224 Commercial Blvd 2645 Charter St. 8051 E Maplewood 11 Stanwix St, 21st Floor 90 East Halsey Rd

Allentown PA  18195 Suite 204 Columbus, Ohio 46228 Suite 210 Pittsburgh, PA 15222 Parisppany NJ  07054

Lauderdale By The Sea Greenwood Village

Item # Quantity Description FL 33308 CO  80111

1 12,000 lbs. Potassium Permanganate 1.4700

2 60,000 lbs. Powdered Activated Carbon 0.5560 0.5850

3 65 dry ton Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 559.0000

4 13,000 lbs. Sodium Tripolyphosphate 0.9780

5 1,700 ton Pebble Lime 176.7900

6 10,500 gal. Liquid Ferric Sulfate 50 % 1.6828

7 50,000 lbs Watersolve 9275, ZetaLyte 1.2790

840C, NRP 8410 Polymer (or equal)

8 190 ton Liquid Carbon Dioxide 122.0000

9 1,650 gal. Aqueous Sodium Bisulfite 1.9600

10 6,000 gal. Liquid Sodium  Hypochlorite 5.25 %

11 4,125 gal Hydrochloric Acid 31% 1.257

BB(bid bond) / CC (Cashiers Check) BB BB BB CC BB BB



CITY OF SIDNEY
BID TABULATION

Purchase of:  Water Treatment Chemicals
Bid Opening Date:  12/01/20
20-WTC-W

Item # Quantity Description

1 12,000 lbs. Potassium Permanganate

2 60,000 lbs. Powdered Activated Carbon

3 65 dry ton Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

4 13,000 lbs. Sodium Tripolyphosphate

5 1,700 ton Pebble Lime

6 10,500 gal. Liquid Ferric Sulfate 50 %

7 50,000 lbs Watersolve 9275, ZetaLyte 
840C, NRP 8410 Polymer (or equal)

8 190 ton Liquid Carbon Dioxide

9 1,650 gal. Aqueous Sodium Bisulfite

10 6,000 gal. Liquid Sodium  Hypochlorite 5.25 %

11 4,125 gal Hydrochloric Acid 31%

BB(bid bond) / CC (Cashiers Check)

George S Coyne Chemical Greer Industries Inc Hexagon Technologies Inc. Kemira Lhoist North America Linde
3015 State Rd. PO Box 1900 PO Box 23163 4321 W 6th St 20947 White Sands Road 7000 High Grove Blvd

Croydon, PA  19021 Morgantown WV  26507-1900 Louisville, KY  40223 Lawrence, KS 66049 Ste. Genevieve, MO  63670 Burr Ridge IL  60527

189.0000 291.4000

1.8150

1.2750

156.8000

NO BID BB CC BB NO BB or CC BB



CITY OF SIDNEY
BID TABULATION

Purchase of:  Water Treatment Chemicals
Bid Opening Date:  12/01/20
20-WTC-W

Item # Quantity Description

1 12,000 lbs. Potassium Permanganate

2 60,000 lbs. Powdered Activated Carbon

3 65 dry ton Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

4 13,000 lbs. Sodium Tripolyphosphate

5 1,700 ton Pebble Lime

6 10,500 gal. Liquid Ferric Sulfate 50 %

7 50,000 lbs Watersolve 9275, ZetaLyte 
840C, NRP 8410 Polymer (or equal)

8 190 ton Liquid Carbon Dioxide

9 1,650 gal. Aqueous Sodium Bisulfite

10 6,000 gal. Liquid Sodium  Hypochlorite 5.25 %

11 4,125 gal Hydrochloric Acid 31%

BB(bid bond) / CC (Cashiers Check)

NRP Midwest LLC Omni Materials Pencco Inc SNF Polydyne Sal Chemical Co
2738 Spring Water Dr 13 West 2nd St PO Box 600 1 Chemical Plant Rd Half Moon Ind Pk

Toledo, Ohio 43617 Maysville KY  41056 San Felipe TX  77473 PO Box 279 3036 Birch Dr

Riceboro GA  31323 Weirton, WV  26062

1.2000

CC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



CITY OF SIDNEY
BID TABULATION

Purchase of:  Water Treatment Chemicals
Bid Opening Date:  12/01/20
20-WTC-W

Item # Quantity Description

1 12,000 lbs. Potassium Permanganate

2 60,000 lbs. Powdered Activated Carbon

3 65 dry ton Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

4 13,000 lbs. Sodium Tripolyphosphate

5 1,700 ton Pebble Lime

6 10,500 gal. Liquid Ferric Sulfate 50 %

7 50,000 lbs Watersolve 9275, ZetaLyte 
840C, NRP 8410 Polymer (or equal)

8 190 ton Liquid Carbon Dioxide

9 1,650 gal. Aqueous Sodium Bisulfite

10 6,000 gal. Liquid Sodium  Hypochlorite 5.25 %

11 4,125 gal Hydrochloric Acid 31%

BB(bid bond) / CC (Cashiers Check)

Shannon Chemical Tri Int'l Trading United Mineral & Chemical Univar USA Inc USALCO
PO Box 376 600 Stewart St 160 Chubb Ave 124 Chapel Hill Dr 2601 Cannery Ave

Malvern, PA 19355 Suite 400 Suite 206 Fairfield, OH  45014 Baltimore, MD 21226

Seattle WA 98101 Lyndhurst NJ  07071

1.4600 1.5070

544.0000 399.130

0.9130

0.9600

2.030

CC BB CC BB BB


	Bid tab

