
CITY OF SIDNEY  

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING PROJECT:  Water Meter Auto Reads

BID TABULATION

Date: August 20, 2009

A-  MATERIALS

Ref. Total Unit Unit Unit Unit

No. Item Description Quantity Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total

1 101 NEPTUNE PRO-READ METERS: 5/8" x 3/4" EQUIPPED WITH RADIO READS EACH 1500 $74.00 $111,000.00 $152.00 $228,000.00 no bid $0.00 $165.85 $248,775.00

2 102 RADIO READS FOR EXISTING PIT TYPE METERS EACH 4000 $93.00 $372,000.00 $92.00 $368,000.00 no bid $0.00 $92.40 $369,600.00

3 103 RADIO READS FOR EXISTING INSIDE METERS EACH 4000 $105.00 $420,000.00 $81.00 $324,000.00 no bid $0.00 $92.40 $369,600.00

4 104 CENTRAL DATA COLLECTORS EACH 5 $18,000.00 $90,000.00 $15,600.00 $78,000.00 no bid $0.00 $4,406.25 $22,031.25

5 105 200 FT COAX CABLE AND CONNECTIONS EACH 5 $686.50 $3,432.50 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 no bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

6 106 FIXED BASE SOFTWARE EACH 1 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $5,600.00 $5,600.00 no bid $0.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

7
107 2 RACK UNIT DELL POWER EDGE SERVER WITH DUAL NETWORK ADAPTORS FOR 

FIBER INTERFACE OR EQUIVALENT
EACH 1 $4,500.00 $4,500.00

$9,000.00 $9,000.00 no bid $0.00 $6,580.00 $6,580.00

8 108 TRAINING AND IMPLEMENTATION (4 DAYS TOTAL) LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 no bid $0.00 $3,590.00 $3,590.00

TOTAL A- MATERIALS $1,016,932.50 $1,019,600.00 $0.00 $1,032,176.25

B- INSTALLATION

1
101 INSTALLATION OF NEPTUNE PRO-READ METERS: 5/8" x 3/4" EQUIPPED WITH RADIO 

READS

EACH 1500 $184.75 $277,125.00

$69.00 $103,500.00 $52.00 $78,000.00 no bid $0.00

2 102 INSTALLATION OF RADIO READS ON EXISTING PIT TYPE METERS EACH 4000 $48.00 $192,000.00 $43.00 $172,000.00 $41.00 $164,000.00 no bid $0.00

3 103 INSTALLATION OF RADIO READS ON EXISTING INSIDE METERS EACH 4000 $40.00 $160,000.00 $59.00 $236,000.00 $55.00 $220,000.00 no bid $0.00

4 104 INSTALLATION OF (4) CENTRAL DATA COLLECTORS LUMP 4 $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 no bid $0.00

5 105 INSTALLATION OF FIXED BASE SOFTWARE LUMP 1 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $800.00 $800.00 no bid $0.00

6
106 INSTALLATION OF 2 RACK UNIT DELL POWER EDGE SERVER WITH DUAL NETWORK 

ADAPTORS FOR FIBER INTERFACE
LUMP 1 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

$0.00 $0.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 no bid $0.00

TOTAL- B- INSTALLATIONS $696,125.00 $532,500.00 $476,300.00 $0.00

GRAND TOTAL A  &  B $1,713,057.50 $1,552,100.00 $476,300.00 $1,032,176.25

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

US Bronco Services, Inc.                 

280 Donald Dr                        

Fairfield, OH  45014

Utility Sales Agency,LLC             

7272 Pleasant Plain Rd                 

Clayton, OH  45315

Neptune Equipment                                          

11082 Southland Rd                        

Cincinnati,OH  45240


