
CITY OF SIDNEY

DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING PROJECT:  2012 Wastewater Biosolids Disposal

BID TABULATION Account No.: 

February 2, 2012 Budget Amount:$

Unit Unit

Description Unit Price Total Price Total

Base

Bid

Removal and land application of 

dewatered (cake) biosolids at agronomic 

rates from the dewatering building 

located at the City's Wastewater 

Treatment Plant to OhioEPA approved 

farm site(s).

Dry Tons $37.00 $29,600.00

Alternate

Bid

Removal and disposal of biosolids in an 

approved sanitary landfill.
Wet

Tons $65.00 $260,000.00

Unit Unit

Description Unit Price Total Price Total

Base

Bid

Removal and proper disposal of 

Dewatered Biosolids from the 

Dewatering Building located at the City's 

Wastewater Treatment Plant to 

approved disposal sites.

Dry Tons $37.50 $30,000.00

Alternate

Bid

Removal and landfill of Dewatered 

Biosolids
Wet

Tons $65.00 $260,000.00

Unit Unit

Description Unit Price Total Price Total

Base

Bid

Removal and proper disposal of 

Dewatered Biosolids from the 

Dewatering Building located at the City's 

Wastewater Treatment Plant to 

approved disposal sites.

Dry Tons $38.00 $30,400.00

Alternate

Bid

Removal and landfill of Dewatered 

Biosolids
Wet

Tons $68.00 $272,000.00

Unit Unit

Description Unit Price Total Price Total

Base

Bid

Removal and proper disposal of 

Dewatered Biosolids from the 

Dewatering Building located at the City's 

Wastewater Treatment Plant to 

approved disposal sites.

Dry Tons $38.00 $30,400.00

Alternate

Bid

Removal and landfill of Dewatered 

Biosolids
Wet

Tons $70.00 $280,000.00

Unit Unit

Description Unit Price Total Price Total

Base

Bid

Removal and proper disposal of 

Dewatered Biosolids from the 

Dewatering Building located at the City's 

Wastewater Treatment Plant to 

approved disposal sites.

Dry Tons $38.00 $30,400.00

Alternate

Bid

Removal and landfill of Dewatered 

Biosolids
Wet

Tons $70.00 $280,000.00

2012

2013

Rumpke

Dayton, OH

Mid-Ohio Sludge Management

Bellevue, OH

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

2014

2015

2016

Note:

Approximate Annual Quantities: 800 dry tons or 3,000 - 4,000 wet tons.

Final Quantities to be adjusted at the end of each year; quantities over the estimate 

above will be paid at the unit price quoted.


